Ref: P&D/02 (124009 Dated: 31.01.2024

Public Procurement Regulatory Authority
Federal Bank for Co- operative Buildings

1 floor Sector G-5/2 Near SBP

Islamabad.

EXTENSION OF TEDER ENQUIRY NO. SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023

Dear Sir,

Please refer to our earlier letter No.SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 (18556) dated 12.01.2024 regarding display
of subject tender enquiry on your website. Tender Enquiry due for opening on g! .01.2024 has been extended

due to reason mentioned below. Same may be displayed on PPRA website.

Tender Enquiry No. Brief Description Extended Tender Reason
Closing Date

Supply and Installation of

SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 |  Energy Efficient Water 220t

(1100 Hrs) No bid received

Geyser (Storage type)

All other terms and conditions of the subject tender enquiry including tender opening venue shall remain the

same. Bids will be opened on 23.02.2024 at 1130 Hrs.

Regards.
Y ours faithfully,
Sui Northern Gas [Pipelines Limited
(Saulat Rashied Lone)
Incharge (P&D)

For Managing Director
N.O.O:
Cc: GM (IT/MIS) - Kindly display the tender on Company ,s website.
Cc: GM (Compliance) —  Kindly depute your representative on tender opening date.

Cc: (GM (Media Affairs) — Kindly adveritize in newspaper.
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Ref: P&D/02 (185X Dated: 12.01.2024

Public Procurement Regulatory Authority
Federal Bank for Co- operative Buildings
1*" floor Sector G-5/2 Near SBP

Islamabad.

EXTENSION OF TEDER ENQUIRY NO. SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023

Dear Sir,

Please refer to our earlier letter No.SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 (18496) dated 22.12.2023. regarding display

of subject tender enquiry on your website. Tender Enquiry due for opening on 12.01.2024 has been extended

due to reason mentioned below. Same may be displayed on PPRA website.

Tender Enquiry No. Brief Description Extended Tender Reason 7
Closing Date
Supply and Installation of
SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 Energy Efficient Water el No bid received
(1100 Hrs)
Geyser (Storage type)

All other terms and conditions of the subject tender enquiry including tender opening venue shall remain the
same. Bids will be opened on 31.01.2024 at 1130 His.

Regards.
Yours fgithfully,
Sui Northern Gas|Hipelines Limited
1
(Farrukh Majeed)
General Manager (P&D)
For Managing Director
N.O.O:
€5 GM (IT/MIS) - Kindly display the tender on Company ,s website. '
) _ _ . IT/MIS Department
Cc: GM (Compliance) — Kindly depute your representative on tender opening date.

Cc: (GM (Media Affairs) — Kindly adveritize in newspaper.

15 JAN 2024
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Ref: P&D/02 (\%14b )

Public Procurement Regulatory Authority

Federal Bank for Co- operative Buildings
1™ floor Sector G-5/2 Near SBP

Islamabad.

Dated: 22.12.2023

EXTENSION OF TEDER ENQUIRY NO. SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023

Dear Sir,

Please refer to our earlier letter No.SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 (18443) dated 04.12.2023 regarding display

of subject tender enquiry on your website. Tender Enquiry due for opening on 22.12.2023 has been extended

due to reason mentioned below. Same may be displayed on PPRA website.

Extended Tender

Tender Enquiry No. Brief Description Reason
Closing Date
Supply and Installation of
SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 Energy Efficient Water 1201 2022 No bid received
(1100 Hrs)
Geyser (Storage type)

All other terms and conditions of the subject tender enquiry including tender opening venue shall remain the

same. Bids will be opened on 12.01.2024 at 1130 Hrs.

Regards.
Yours faithfully,
Sui Northern Gf3\Pipelines Limited
(Farrukh Majeed)

General Mdnager (P&D)

For Managing Director
N.O.O:
Cc: GM (IT/MIS) - Kindly display the tender on Company ,s website.
Cc: GM (Compliance) — Kindly depute your representative on tender opening date. iTINES e s UGN

Cc: (GM (Media Affairs) — Kindly adveritize in newspaper.
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Ref: P&D/02 (\443) Dated: 04.12.2023

Public Procurement Regulatory Authority
Federal Bank for Co- operative Buildings

1¥ floor Sector G-5/2 Near SBP

Islamabad.

EXTENSION OF TEDER ENQUIRY NO. SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023

Dear Sir,

Please refer to our earlier letter No.SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 (183 88) dated 15.11.2023 regarding dispiay
of subject tender enquiry on your website. Tender Enquiry due for opening on 04.12.2023 has been extended

due to reason mentioned below. Same may be displayed on PPRA website.

Tender Enquiry No. Brief Description Extended Tender Reason
Closing Date

Supply and Installation of
SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 Energy Efficient Water
Geyser (Storage type)

22.12.2023

(1100 Hrs) No bid received

All other terms and conditions of the subject tender enquiry including tender opening venue shall remain the

same. Bids will be opened on 22.12.2023 at 1130 Hrs.

Regards.
YourgLaithfully,
Sui Northern @ elines Limited
(Farrukh Majeed)

General Manager (P&D)

For Managing Director
N.O.O: -
Cc: GM (IT/MIS) - Kindly display the tender on Company ,s website.
Cc: GM (Compliance) —  Kindly depute your representative on tender opening date. IT/IMiS Department
Cc: (GM (Media Affairs) — Kindly adveritize in newspaper.

: i 05 DEC 2023
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Ref: P&D/02 (18385)

Public Procurement Regulatory Authority
Federal Bank for Co- operative Buildings
1*" floor Sector G-5/2 Near SBP

Islamabad.

Dated: 15.11.2023

EXTENSION OF TEDER ENQUIRY NO. SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2623

Dear Sir,

Please refer to our earlier letter No.SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 (18324) dated 20.10.2023 regarding display

of subject tender enquiry on your website. Tender Enquiry due for opening on 15.11.2023 has been extended

due to reason mentioned below. Same may be displayed on PPRA website.

Tender Enquiry No. Brief Description Extended Tender
Closing Date

Reason

Supply and Installation of

SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023 |  Energy Efficient Water Ua-123023

(1100 Hrs)

Geyser (Storage type)

No bid received

All other terms and conditions of the subject tender enquiry including tender opening venue shall remain the

same. Bids will be opened on 04.12.2023 at 1130 Hrs.

Yours faithfully,

Sui Northern Gas\Pipelines Limited

(Farrukh Majeed)
General Manager (P&D)
For Managing Director

Regards.
N.0.O: .
Cc: GM (IT/MIS) - Kindly display the tender on Company ,s website.
Cc: GM (Compliance) — Kindly depute your representative on tender opening date.

Cc: (GM (Media Affairs) — Kindly adveritize in newspaper.

[T/MIS Department]|

15 NOV 2023
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Ref: SNGPL/P & D/EEG/2023 = \231"\ Dated: 20.10.2023

The Deputy Director (M & IMP) Government of Pakistan,
Public Procurement Regulatory Authority,

Federal Bank for Cooperative Building,

1% Floor, Sector G-5/2,

Islamabad.

Fax No. 051-9224823

INVITATION TO BID
SNGPL/P&D/EEG/2023

In compliance to Rule 12 of Public Procurement Rules, 2004, we give hereunder information pertaining to tender
enquiry issued from Sui Northern Gas Pipelines Limited (SNGPL)’s P & D Department, Head Office, for
displaying on PPRA’s website:-

Name of Procuring Agency SNGPL
Tender number (for identification) SNGPL/P&L/EEG/2023
Title of procurement Supply a:.—d: ;r_.s:t_ai?‘;tm—; of Energy Efficient Water Geyser
(indicating type and quantity) (Storage tyre)
Mr. Muhammad Hashim
Contact person (Senior Engineer P & D, SNGPL Head Office)
042-99201376, 0334-4188809
Tender Closing Date & Time 15.11.2023, on 1100 Hours
Time and date for Bid opening 15.11.2023, on 1130 Hours

Tender documents contairing detailed terms and conditions are
available ana can be obtained through a request on company’s letter
head along with photocopy of CNIC from Planning and
Development (P & 1)) department SNGPL., Third Floor, Gas
Tender Documents House, 21-Kashmir Road Lahore. (Timings 0830 Hrs to 1700
Hrs)

Price of bidding documnents is Rs, 2500/- (Non-Refundable)

Note: Pay order of Rs.2500/- to be submitted in favor of “Sui
Northern Gas Pipelines Limited”

Thanking you with best regards,

Your$ Sincerely,
SUI NORTHERN GAS PIPELINES LIMITED

)
(Farrukh Majeed)

General Manager (P & D)
for MANAGING DIRECTOR

Copy by Post: The Deputy Director (M & IMP) Government of Pakistan, Islamabad.

N.0.O:

A’ GM (IT / MIS) - Kindly display the tender on Company 's webhsite
cc: GM (Compliance) - Kindly depute your representative on tender opening date.
cc: GM (Media Affairs) - Kindly adveritize in newspaper.






